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Partners 

 
1.35 Payne Hicks Beach has promoted Chris 
Weaver to partner. Weaver qualified as a 
solicitor in 2005, before joining the firm’s 
employment law department in 2009 as an 
associate. He was promoted to senior 
associate in 2015. Weaver advises both 
employers and employees on a range of high-
value and complex matters. His areas of 
expertise include advising on the departure of 
directors and senior executives, redundancy 
consultation exercises and business 
reorganisations, disciplinary investigations, and 
TUPE. He also has extensive experience 
advising corporate clients on all aspects of UK 
data protection law, GDPR and Data 
Protection Act 2018 compliance. 
 

1.49 Payne Hicks Beach has promoted 
Charlotte Skea-Strachan to legal director. 
She joined the family department in 2006 
and was promoted to senior associate in 
2015. Skea-Strachan advises on all areas of 
family law, both contentious and non-
contentious, particularly in relation to high-
value cases, and those with a complex 
international aspect. Her expertise includes 
pre- and mid-nuptial agreements, divorce, 
co-habitation and complex financial disputes. 
She is also an expert in private children 
matters. 
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